Tabulation

RFQ #2010-27

Computer and Copy Paper

1 January 2010 through 31 March 2010

Awarded to: Premium Foods and Olmsted-Kirk

Global

Olmsted- | Premium | Industry

Description Item Kirk Foods Products

14 7/8 X 11, 20#, 2" 1 PART, GREENBAR PAPER 1573 No Bid 27.60 50.20
912X 11, 20#, WHITE 1 PART, COMPUTER PAPER 1574 No Bid 19.69 34.12
912 X 11, NCR, WHITE 2 PART, COMPUTER PAPER 1575 No Bid 30.40 55.60
912 X 11, NCR, WHITE 3 PART, COMPUTER PAPER 1576 No Bid 37.57 64.41
91 X 11, NCR, W/C/P 3 PART, COMPUTER PAPER 1577 No Bid 43.98 65.55
812X 11, 20#, WHITE COPY PAPER, 01-75 CS 1578 30.00 29.85 51.88
8 12 X 14, 20#, WHITE COPY PAPER, 01-75 CS 1579 41.10 42.45 69.23
812X 11, 20#, WHITE COPY PAPER, 76 AND OVER 1580 30.00 29.10 51.88
8 12 X 14, 20#, WHITE COPY PAPER, 76 AND OVER 1581 41.10 41.20 69.23
812X 11, 20#, WHITE, 3-HOLE, COPY PAPER, 01-75 CS 1582 32.30 33.50 56.55
11 X 17, 20#, WHITE COPY PAPER, 76 AND OVER 1583 32.30 33.75 56.55
812 X 11, 20#, GREEN COPY PAPER, 01-75 CS 1584 37.80 38.13 60.95
11 X 17, 20#, WHITE COPY PAPER, 01-75 CS 1585 32.30 34.00 56.00
812X 11, 20#, GREEN COPY PAPER, 76 AND OVER 1571 37.80 38.13 60.95
812 X 11, 20#, WHITE, 3-HOLE, COPY PAPER 76 & OVE 1572 32.30 33.25 56.55
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