Tabulation
Bid 16-024

Purchase of Vehicles

Awarded 10/6/15: Low Bidder Per Item
Renewed 9/27/2016 through 9/30/2017

Description Caldwell Caldwell Classic Grande Grapevine Helfman Helfman
Country [Country Ford| Chevrolet |Truck Center DCJ Dodge Ford
Chevrolet Caldwell Sugar Land | San Antonio | Grapevine Houston Stafford
Caldwell
Vehicle 9: Truck, 1/2 ton, Extended No Bid $24,279.00 | Disqualified: | $24,508.00 | Disqualified: No Bid $22,000.00
Cab, SWB, Cloth bench, Power Does not meet Does not meet
(windows, locks), TTP specifications specifications
Vehicle 10: Truck, 1/2 ton, Extended No Bid $24,279.00 | Disqualified: | $24,508.00 | Disqualified: No Bid $22,000.00
Cab, SWB, Vinyl Bench, Power Does not meet Does not meet
(windows, locks), TTP specifications specifications
Vehicle 11: Truck, 1/2 ton, Extended No Bid Disqualified: No Bid $23,407.00 No Bid No Bid $24,070.00
Cab, SWB, Vinyl Bench, Power Does not meet within 3% from a
(seats, windows, locks), TTP specifications local vendor
pursuant to
§271.905
Vehicle 19: Truck, Ford, F-150, Crew|  No Bid $26,467.00 No Bid $27,022.00 No Bid No Bid $24,100.00
Cab, Special Service Truck, Cloth,
Power (windows, locks, mirrors),
TTP
Vehicle 20: Truck, Ford, 1/2 Ton, No Bid $27,767.00 No Bid $26,863.00 No Bid No Bid $25,215.00
Crew Cab, Special Service, Cloth,
Power (windows, locks, mirrors),
TTP, Lockable Hard Cover to Match
Vehicle 21: Truck, 1/2 ton, Crew No Bid $26,467.00 No Bid $27,022.00 | $25,501.00 No Bid $24,100.00

Cab, Special Service, Cloth, Power
(windows, locks, mirrors), TTP
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