Fort Bend County Pricing Form
BID 19-034
Term Contract for Oil and Lubricants
Term: 1 April 2019 through 31 March 2020

Awarded 3/12/19:

Sections 10.1, 10.2 and 10.4 to Low Bidder per Item and Section 10.3 to Low Bidder per Subsection

*Amended 7.23.19

Oil and Lubricants Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC Dallas Houston
Houston
Section 10.1: CHEVRON PRODUCTS Form 1295
SAE 10W30 CJ-4/SM Delo 400 XLE Yes Yes Yes
Per Quart in Quart Container 12573 [$ 5.69 No Bid| $ 7.75
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 12574 T$ 15.77 No Bid| $ 20.85
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 12575 % 14.31 No Bid| $ 19.32
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 12576 % 13.86 No Bid| $ 16.70
SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 Delo 400 Lawson | AJ. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart in Quart Container 1289 [$ 4.32 No Bid| $ 5.96
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 5341 I$ 15.46 No Bid| $ 19.85
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1290 [$ 13.40 No Bid| $ 18.95
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 5342 I$ 12.40 No Bid| $ 15.39
Per Gallon in Bulk 5343 I$ 11.40 No Bid| $ 13.16
SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 Delo 400 XLE Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart in Quart Container 13808 [$ 5.69 No Bid N/A
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 13809 [$ 22.45 No Bid| $ 30.86
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13810 [$ 13.09 No Bid| $ 25.60
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13811 [$ 12.64 No Bid| $ 16.70
Per Gallon in Bulk 13812 [$ 11.80 No Bid| $ 14.45
SAE 10 Delo 400 Lawson | AJ. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13813 [$ 15.69 No Bid| $ 28.68
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13814 [$ 14.25 No Bid| $ 19.63
SAE 30 Delo 400 Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart in Quart Container 1305 [$ 4.37 No Bid| $ 5.99
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1306 [$ 14.58 No Bid| $ 18.12
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 1307 [$ 12.81 No Bid| $ 15.67




Section 10.1: CHEVRON PRODUCTS (cont'd)

SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train (Meets Cat’s TO-4 Lawson | A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Specifications) Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1352 % 12.30 No Bid| $ 15.18
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 1353 % 11.41 No Bid| $ 14.13
Hydraulic Oil 1SO-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-268-S) Lawson | A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1330 % 9.93 No Bid| $ 9.80
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 1331 % 8.34 No Bid| $ 8.00
Per Gallon in Bulk 1332 1% 7.02 No Bid| $ 6.80
Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-286-S) Lawson | A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1359 1% 9.93 No Bid| $ 9.80
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 1360 [$ 8.34 No Bid| $ 8.00
TDH Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Deere Lawson | A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
J20C) Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 5352 % 12.95 No Bid| $ 23.68
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 5353 % 12.24 No Bid| $ 13.61
Per Gallon in Bulk 5354 $ 10.58 No Bid| $ 9.64
Grease Ultra-Duty EP2 Lawson | AJ. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Tube 1380 % 4.05 No Bid| $ 3.75
Per 35# Container 1381 $ 132.56 No Bid| $ 132.30
Per 120# Container 1382 % 490.77 No Bid| $ 450.00
Gear Oil 85-140 GL-5 Lawson [ A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart in Quart Container NA No Bid NA
Per 35# Container 1383 1B 108.38 No Bid| $ 99.05
Gear Oil, Universal 85-140 GL-5 Lawson [ A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per 35# Container 13336 [ 108.38 No Bid| $ 99.05




Section 10.2: CONOCO/PHILLIPS

SAE 5W-20 SM, GF-4 76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil | Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container 5355 % 3.43 No Bid No Bid
SAE 5W-30 SM, GF-4 76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Qil Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container 5358 I$ 3.44 No Bid No Bid
SAE 10W-30 SM, GF-4 76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil| Lawson [ A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container 1369 [$ 2.96 No Bid No Bid
SAE 10W-30 Guardol FE Lawson [ A.J.HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container 13815 | 5.32 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Pail 13816 B 20.39 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13817 BB 12.97 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13818 B 13.49 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in Bulk 13819 11.50 No Bid No Bid
SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 SM Guardol ECT Synthetic Blend Lawson [ A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container 1293 [$ 5.30 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Pail 5367 I$ 16.44 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1294  [$ 12.68 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 1295  [$ 12.83 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in Bulk 5368  [$ 11.21 No Bid No Bid
SAE 10W 76 T5X 10 Lawson | AJ. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1302 [$ 21.19 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 1303 [$ 11.50 No Bid No Bid
SAE 30 76 T5X 30 Lawson | A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 5371 % 14.53 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 5372 I$ 14.10 No Bid No Bid
SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train 76 HT-4 50 (Meets Cat’s Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
TO-4 Specification) Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail NA No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 1356 [$ 15.35 No Bid No Bid




Section 10.2: CONOCO/PHILLIPS (cont'd)

Synthetic Transoil 50 GL-1/MP-1 (Eaton Roadranger PS- Lawson | A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
164 Rev 7) Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13820 T$ 22.25 No Bid No Bid
Mercon V Automatic Transmission Fluid Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container 1402 [$ 6.23 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail NA No Bid No Bid
Hydraulic Oil 1SO-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-268-S) Lawson | A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 1333 [$ 10.45 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 1334 [$ 8.78 No Bid No Bid
Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-286-S) Lawson [ A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 5423  [$ 8.75 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 5424  [$ 7.30 No Bid No Bid
TDH Oil Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Deere J20C) Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 5386  |$ 10.36 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 5387 1§ 9.34 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in Bulk 5388 I§ 8.89 No Bid No Bid
Grease NLGI GC-LB Calcium Sulfonate Lawson | A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Tube, in Case lot 1387 B 4.98 No Bid No Bid
Per 35# Container 1388 1B 179.20 No Bid No Bid
Per 120# Container 1389 B 602.78 No Bid No Bid
Gear Oil 85-140 GL-5/MP-1 76MP Gear Lube Lawson [ A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container NA No Bid No Bid
Per 35# Container 5389 I§ 89.21 No Bid No Bid
Per 120# Container 5390 | 336.96 No Bid No Bid
Mercon VI Automatic Transmission Fluid Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container 10399 B 6.02 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail NA No Bid No Bid
ATF+4 Transmission Fluid Lawson [ A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container NA No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail NA No Bid No Bid




Section 10.2: CONOCO/PHILLIPS (cont'd)

Dexron VI Automatic Transmission Fluid Lawson [ A.J.HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container 10032 B 6.02 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail NA No Bid No Bid
Gear Oil 75W-90 Synthetic Lawson [ A.J.HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container NA No Bid No Bid
Per 35# Container NA No Bid No Bid
Gear Oil 75W-140 Synthetic Lawson [ A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container NA No Bid No Bid
Per 35# Container NA No Bid No Bid




Section 10.3: ANTIFREEZE
Subsection 10.3.1

Multi-Vehicle Antifreeze, concentrated Lawson [ A.J.HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
CHV UNIVERSAL A/F CONCENTRATE
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 7690 12.81 No Bid| $ 13.42
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 7691 B 13.16 No Bid| $ 17.30
Subsection 10.3.2
Multi-Vehicle Antifreeze, ready-to-use Lawson [ A.J.HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
CHV UNIVERSAL 50/50 AF
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 9036 1 10.90 No Bid| $ 10.50
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 9037 B 9.36 No Bid| $ 8.70




Section 10.4: GENERIC
Subsection 10.4.1 Chevron Products or Equal to

SAE 10W30 CJ-4/SM Delo 400 XLE Lawson [ A.J.HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
PERFORMANCE PLUS
Per Quart in Quart Container No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Bottle 13822 No Bid| $ 13.57 No Bid
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13823 No Bid| $ 11.43 No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13824 No Bid| $ 11.04 No Bid
SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 Delo 400 Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
ALLFLEET SYN BLEND 15W40
Per Quart in Quart Container 13337 [$ 353 $ 12.64 No Bid
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13338 % 958 [ $ 8.89 No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13339 % 838 $ 8.58 No Bid
Per Gallon in Bulk 13340 [$ 750 ] $ 7.06 No Bid
SAE 30 Delo 400 Lawson | AJ. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart in Quart Container No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid
SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train (Meets Cat’s requiring TO-| Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
4 Fluids) Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
PERFORMANCE PLUS
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13825 No Bid| $ 13.75 No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13826 No Bid| $ 12.64 No Bid
Hydraulic Oil 1SO-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-268-S) Lawson [ A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail, ALLFLEET PRM AW 46 13341 1% 6.84 [ $ 6.52 No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum, ALLFLEET PRM AW 46 13342 1% 6421 $ 6.06 No Bid
Per Gallon in Bulk, PERFORMANCE PLUS 13343 $ 4971 $ 4.88 No Bid
Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-286-S) Lawson [ A.J.HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
ALLFLEET PRM AW 68
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13344 % 7271 $ 6.76 No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13345 % 6.84 | $ 6.21 No Bid
TDH Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Deere Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
J20C) Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
ARM ECON TRACTOR HYD
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13346 [$ 8221 % 7.88 No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13347 T$ 7181 $ 7.12 No Bid
Per Gallon in Bulk 13348 % 599 | $ 5.77 No Bid




Subsection 10.4.1 Chevron Products or Equal to (cont'd)

Grease Ultra-Duty EP2 Lawson | AJ. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Tube No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per 35# Container No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per 120# Container No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gear Oil 85-140 GL-5 Lawson | AJ. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per 35# Container No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gear Oil, Universal 85-140 GL-5 Lawson [ A.J.HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per 35# Container No Bid No Bid No Bid




Subsection 10.4.2: Conoco/Phillips or Equal to

SAE 5W-20 SM, GF-4 76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil | Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
DURAMAX SB 5W20
Per Quart, in Quart Container 13349 | $ 1771 $ 1.92 No Bid
SAE 5W-30 SM, GF-4 76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil Lawson | AJ. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
DURAMAX SB 5W30
Per Quart, in Quart Container 13350 $ 184 | $ 1.92 No Bid
SAE 10W-30 SM, GF-4 76 Super Synthetic Blend Motor Oil| Lawson [ A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
DURAMAX SB 10W30
Per Quart, in Quart Container 13351 $ 1771 $ 1.92 No Bid
SAE 15W-40 CJ-4 SM Guardol ECT Synthetic Blend Lawson | AJ. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
ALLFLEET SB 15W40
Per Quart, in Quart Container 13352 $ 310 $ 3.16 No Bid
Per Gallon in 1 Gallon Pail 13353 $ 944 | $ 9.50 No Bid
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13354 $ 840 ([ $ 8.89 No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13355 $ 7351 $ 8.58 No Bid
SAE 10W 76 T5X 10 Lawson | AJ. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
CHEVRON URSA HYD 10W
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13356 $ 11.23 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13357 $ 10.46 No Bid No Bid
SAE 30 76 T5X 30 Lawson | A.J. Hurt Jr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13358 3 17.95 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13359 3 11.33 No Bid No Bid
SAE 50 Heavy Duty Drive Train 76 HT-4 50 (Meets Cat’s Lawson | A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
TO-4 Specification) Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail, CHVY TORQFORCE 50 13360 $ 10.78 [ $ 13.75 No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13361 $ 1001 [ $ 11.93 Vendor withdrew
Synthetic Transoil 50 GL-1/MP-1 (Eaton Roadranger PS- Lawson [ A.J.HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
164 Rev 7) Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
CHV DELO SYN-TRANS HD SAE 50
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13362 3 34.46 No Bid No Bid




Subsection 10.4.2: Conoco/Phillips or Equal to (cont'd)

Mercon V Automatic Transmission Fluid Lawson [ A.J.HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF
Per Quart, in Quart Container 13363 $ 3.03 No Bid No Bid
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13364 $ 11.20 No Bid No Bid
Hydraulic Oil 1SO-46 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-268-S) Lawson [ A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
ALLFLEET PRM AW 46
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13365 $ 6.00| $ 6.52 No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13366 $ 563 [ $ 5.76 No Bid
Hydraulic Oil AW 68 (Denison HF-2, Vickers 1-286-S) Lawson | A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail, ALLFLEET PRM AW 68 13367 $ 6.38 | $ 6.52 No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum, PERFORMANCE PLUS 13368 3 6.00] $ 5.76 No Bid
TDH Oil Hydraulic/Tractor Fluid (Case MS-1207, John Lawson | A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Deere J20C) Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
ARM ECON TRACTOR HYD FLD
Per Gallon in 5 Gallon Pail 13369 $ 7211 $ 7.67 No Bid
Per Gallon in 55 Gallon Drum 13370 $ 6.30 | $ 7.23 No Bid
Per Gallon in Bulk 13371 $ 525 $ 5.71 No Bid
Grease NLGI GC-LB Calcium Sulfonate Lawson [ A.J.HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Tube, in Case lot No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per 35# Container No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per 120# Container No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gear Oil 85-140 GL-5/MP-1 76 MP Gear Lube Lawson | A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per 35# Container NA No Bid No Bid
Per 120# Container NA No Bid No Bid
Mercon VI Automatic Transmission Fluid Lawson [ A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF
Per Quart, in Quart Container 13372 $ 3.03 No Bid No Bid
ATF+4 Transmission Fluid Lawson | A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF
Per Quart, in Quart Container 13827 3 3.03 No Bid No Bid




Subsection 10.4.2: Conoco/Phillips or Equal to (cont'd)

Dexron VI Automatic Transmission Fluid Lawson [ A.J.HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
DURAMAX GLOBAL SYN ATF
Per Quart, in Quart Container 13373 3 3.03 No Bid No Bid
Gear Oil 75W-90 Synthetic Lawson [ A.J. HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gear Oil 75W-140 Synthetic Lawson [ A.J.HurtJr., Inc. Safety-Kleen Sun Coast
Numbers division of Systems Inc. Resources, Inc.
RelaDyne LLC
Per Quart, in Quart Container No Bid No Bid No Bid

Atlantic Petroleum - Disqualified: Altered Pricing Form, and No required forms provided with response.

Houston Pasadena Apache Oil Company - Disqualified: No required forms provided with response.
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