

**Fort Bend County Tabulation
 Bid 19-035
 Term Contract for Culverts**

Term: 1 April 2019 through 31 March 2020

**Awarded 2/26/19: Low Bidder per Item
 Renewal Approved 01/14/20: 1 April 2020 through 31 March 2021**

10.1 2-2/3" X 1/2" Corrugation Full Circle Pipe, Galvanized, Conforms to AASHTO M218 (price per foot)				
16 Gauge	Lawson Number	Accurate Utility Supply Katy	Core & Main Houston	Wyatt Resources Fulshear
		Form 1295		
		Yes	Yes	Yes
Spiral				
18"	7347	\$ 17.75	No Bid	\$ 17.09
24"	7348	\$ 23.00	No Bid	\$ 22.12
30"	7349	\$ 29.15	No Bid	\$ 27.97
36"	7350	\$ 34.04	No Bid	\$ 33.47
42"	7351	\$ 40.50	No Bid	\$ 38.72
48"	7352	\$ 46.55	No Bid	\$ 52.16
54"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
60"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
66"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
Rivited				
18"	1072	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 17.09
24"	1073	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 22.12
30"	1074	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 27.97
36"	1075	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 33.47
42"	1076	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 38.72
48"	1077	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 52.16
54"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
60"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
66"		No Bid	No Bid	NA

14 Gauge	Lawson Number	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
Spiral				
18"	7353	\$ 21.10	No Bid	\$ 24.70
24"	7354	\$ 27.90	No Bid	\$ 32.65
30"	7355	\$ 34.75	No Bid	\$ 40.78
36"	7356	\$ 40.45	No Bid	\$ 48.63
42"	7357	\$ 47.95	No Bid	\$ 56.62
48"	7358	\$ 55.25	No Bid	\$ 64.84
54"	7359	\$ 62.00	No Bid	\$ 72.77
60"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
66"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
Rivited				
18"	1078	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 24.70
24"	1079	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 32.65
30"	1080	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 40.78
36"	1081	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 48.63
42"	1082	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 56.62
48"	1083	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 64.84
54"	1084	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 72.77
60"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
66"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
12 Gauge	Lawson Number	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
Spiral				
18"	7361	\$ 29.45	No Bid	\$ 34.08
24"	7362	\$ 40.00	No Bid	\$ 44.70
30"	7363	\$ 49.80	No Bid	\$ 55.78
36"	7364	\$ 59.15	No Bid	\$ 66.39
42"	7365	\$ 69.05	No Bid	\$ 77.35
48"	7366	\$ 78.15	No Bid	\$ 88.63
54"	7367	\$ 89.00	No Bid	\$ 99.55
60"	7368	\$ 100.25	No Bid	\$ 112.33
66"	7369	\$ 111.55	No Bid	\$ 124.33
Rivited				
18"	1086	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 34.08
24"	1087	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 44.70
30"	1088	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 55.78
36"	1089	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 66.39
42"	1090	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 77.35
48"	1091	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 88.63
54"	1092	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 99.55
60"	1093	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 112.33
66"	1094	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 124.33

10.2 2-2/3" X 1/2" Corrugation Full Circle Pipe, Polymer Coated, Conforms to AASHTO M245 & M246 (price per foot)

16 Gauge	Lawson Number	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
Spiral				
18"	7370	\$ 23.80	No Bid	\$ 22.71
24"	7371	\$ 31.00	No Bid	\$ 29.56
30"	7372	\$ 35.08	No Bid	\$ 37.32
36"	7373	\$ 46.70	No Bid	\$ 44.62
42"	7374	\$ 53.95	No Bid	\$ 51.69
48"	7375	\$ 62.15	No Bid	\$ 64.75
54"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
60"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
Rivited				
18"	1095	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 22.71
24"	1096	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.56
30"	1097	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 37.32
36"	1098	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 44.62
42"	1099	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 51.69
48"	1100	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 64.75
54"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
60"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
14 Gauge	Lawson Number	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
Spiral				
18"	7376	\$ 29.00	No Bid	\$ 30.48
24"	7377	\$ 39.00	No Bid	\$ 40.29
30"	7378	\$ 48.75	No Bid	\$ 50.38
36"	7379	\$ 58.35	No Bid	\$ 60.08
42"	7380	\$ 66.95	No Bid	\$ 69.94
48"	7381	\$ 77.80	No Bid	\$ 80.12
54"	7382	\$ 83.35	No Bid	\$ 89.80
60"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
Rivited				
18"	1101	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 30.48
24"	1102	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 40.29
30"	1103	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 50.38
36"	1104	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 60.08
42"	1105	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 69.94
48"	1106	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 80.12
54"	1107	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 89.80
60"		No Bid	No Bid	NA

12 Gauge	Lawson Number	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
Spiral				
18"	7383	\$ 41.00	No Bid	\$ 41.83
24"	7384	\$ 53.80	No Bid	\$ 54.93
30"	7385	\$ 67.15	No Bid	\$ 68.63
36"	7386	\$ 79.55	No Bid	\$ 81.74
42"	7387	\$ 93.65	No Bid	\$ 95.20
48"	7388	\$ 106.70	No Bid	\$ 109.10
54"	7389	\$ 119.85	No Bid	\$ 122.37
60"	9936	\$ 134.95	No Bid	\$ 137.47
Rivited				
18"	1108	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 41.83
24"	1109	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 54.93
30"	1110	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 68.63
36"	1111	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 81.74
42"	1112	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 95.20
48"	1113	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 109.10
54"	1114	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 122.37
60"	9517	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 137.47

**10.3 Pipe Bands for 2-2/3" X 1/2" Corrugation Full Circle Pipe, Polymer Coated, Conforms to AASHTO M245 & M246 - 2' long
No Minimums (price per each)**

16 Gauge	Lawson Number	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
Spiral				
18" x 24"	13751	\$ 59.75	No Bid	\$ 61.85
24" x 24"	13752	\$ 72.80	No Bid	\$ 73.90
30" x 24"	13753	\$ 97.70	No Bid	\$ 93.30
36" x 24"	13754	\$ 115.00	No Bid	\$ 111.55
42" x 24"	13755	\$ 135.00	No Bid	\$ 129.23
48" x 24"	13756	\$ 155.00	No Bid	\$ 161.88
54" x 24"	13757	\$ 175.00	No Bid	NA
60" x 24"	13758	\$ 196.50	No Bid	NA
Rivited				
18" x 24"	13759	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 61.85
24" x 24"	13760	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 73.90
30" x 24"	13761	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 93.30
36" x 24"	13762	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 111.55
42" x 24"	13763	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 129.23
48" x 24"	13764	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 161.88
54" x 24"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
60" x 24"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
14 Gauge	Lawson Number	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
Spiral				
18" x 24"	13765	\$ 74.10	No Bid	\$ 76.20
24" x 24"	13766	\$ 97.50	No Bid	\$ 100.73
30" x 24"	13767	\$ 122.40	No Bid	\$ 125.95
36" x 24"	13768	\$ 145.90	No Bid	\$ 150.20
42" x 24"	13769	\$ 169.00	No Bid	\$ 174.85
48" x 24"	13770	\$ 193.00	No Bid	\$ 200.30
54" x 24"	13771	\$ 217.50	No Bid	\$ 224.50
60" x 24"	13772	\$ 280.00	No Bid	NA
Rivited				
18" x 24"	13773	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 76.20
24" x 24"	13774	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 100.73
30" x 24"	13775	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 125.95
36" x 24"	13776	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 150.20
42" x 24"	13777	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 174.85
48" x 24"	13778	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 200.30
54" x 24"	13779	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 224.50
60" x 24"		No Bid	No Bid	NA

12 Gauge	Lawson Number	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
Spiral				
18" x 24"	13780	\$ 101.00	No Bid	\$ 104.58
24" x 24"	13781	\$ 134.60	No Bid	\$ 137.33
30" x 24"	13782	\$ 167.95	No Bid	\$ 171.57
36" x 24"	13783	\$ 200.00	No Bid	\$ 204.35
42" x 24"	13784	\$ 240.00	No Bid	\$ 238.00
48" x 24"	13785	\$ 265.00	No Bid	\$ 272.75
54" x 24"	13786	\$ 295.00	No Bid	\$ 305.93
60" x 24"	13787	\$ 335.00	No Bid	\$ 343.68
Rivited				
18" x 24"	13788	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 104.58
24" x 24"	13789	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 137.33
30" x 24"	13790	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 171.57
36" x 24"	13791	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 204.35
42" x 24"	13792	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 238.00
48" x 24"	13793	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 272.75
54" x 24"	13794	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 305.93
60" x 24"	13795	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 343.68

10.4 2-2/3" X 1/2" Corrugation Full Circle Pipe, Aluminized, Conforms to AASHTO M36 & M274 (price per foot)

16 Gauge	Lawson Number	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
Spiral				
18"	7390	\$ 21.15	No Bid	\$ 20.32
24"	7391	\$ 27.30	No Bid	\$ 26.39
30"	7392	\$ 34.50	No Bid	\$ 33.24
36"	7393	\$ 41.25	No Bid	\$ 39.74
42"	7394	\$ 48.25	No Bid	\$ 46.43
48"	7395	\$ 55.10	No Bid	\$ 53.06
54"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
60"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
66"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
Rivited				
18"	1115	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 20.32
24"	1116	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 26.39
30"	1117	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 33.24
36"	1118	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 39.74
42"	1119	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 46.43
48"	1120	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 53.06
54"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
60"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
66"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
14 Gauge	Lawson Number	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
Spiral				
18"	7396	\$ 26.15	No Bid	\$ 25.27
24"	7397	\$ 34.55	No Bid	\$ 33.40
30"	7398	\$ 43.15	No Bid	\$ 41.73
36"	7399	\$ 57.40	No Bid	\$ 49.75
42"	7400	\$ 59.90	No Bid	\$ 57.93
48"	7401	\$ 61.55	No Bid	\$ 66.34
54"	7402	\$ 77.00	No Bid	\$ 77.44
60"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
66"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
Rivited				
18"	1124	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 25.27
24"	1125	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 33.40
30"	1126	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 41.73
36"	1127	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 49.75
42"	1128	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 57.93
48"	1129	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 66.34
54"	1130	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 77.44
60"		No Bid	No Bid	NA
66"		No Bid	No Bid	NA

12 Gauge	Lawson Number	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
Spiral				
18"	7403	\$ 36.20	No Bid	\$ 35.10
24"	7404	\$ 47.40	No Bid	\$ 46.03
30"	7405	\$ 59.10	No Bid	\$ 57.45
36"	7406	\$ 70.35	No Bid	\$ 68.39
42"	7407	\$ 82.00	No Bid	\$ 79.68
48"	7408	\$ 93.95	No Bid	\$ 91.30
54"	7409	\$ 105.60	No Bid	\$ 102.53
60"	7410	\$ 118.00	No Bid	\$ 115.34
66"	7411	\$ 131.55	No Bid	\$ 128.01
Rivited				
18"	1133	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 35.10
24"	1134	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 46.03
30"	1135	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 57.45
36"	1136	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 68.39
42"	1137	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 79.68
48"	1138	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 91.30
54"	1139	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 102.53
60"	1140	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 115.34
66"	1141	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 128.01

10.5 Metal Flared End Section with Hardware to Fit Corrugated Pipe, full Circle Pipe, AASHTO M218

Size	Lawson Number	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
12"	1142	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 96.16
15"	1143	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 122.18
18"	1144	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 158.42
24"	1145	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 236.40
30"	1146	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 431.55
36"	1147	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 695.65
42"	1148	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,311.60
48"	1149	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,526.94
54"	1150	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,809.60
60"	1151	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,714.40
66"	1152	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,917.20
72"	1153	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3,234.00
78"	1154	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3,506.29

**10.6 T & G Reinforced Concrete Pipe Culverts, Class 3, TXDOT #464
No Minimums (price per foot)**

Size	Lawson Number	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
18"	1155	\$ 25.20	No Bid	No Bid
24"	1156	\$ 33.60	No Bid	No Bid
30"	1157	\$ 44.80	No Bid	No Bid
36"	1158	\$ 69.06	No Bid	No Bid
42"	1159	\$ 92.10	No Bid	No Bid
48"	1160	\$ 118.66	No Bid	No Bid
54"	1161	\$ 168.88	No Bid	No Bid
60"	1162	\$ 204.51	No Bid	No Bid
66"		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
72"	1164	\$ 285.33	No Bid	No Bid
78"		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
84"	1166	\$ 406.25	No Bid	No Bid

10.7 Rubber Gasketed Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class 3, TXDOT #464

Size	Lawson Number	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
18"		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24"		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30"		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
36"		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
42"		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
48"		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
54"		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
60"		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
66"		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
72"		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
78"		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
84"		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

**10.8 Sloped End Treatments, 4:1, Reinforced Concrete Pipe Culverts without bars
THD #464**

Size	Lawson Number	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
18"	13796	\$ 375.00	No Bid	No Bid
24"	13797	\$ 656.25	No Bid	No Bid
30"	13798	\$ 1,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
36"	13799	\$ 1,687.50	No Bid	No Bid

**10.9 Sloped End Treatments, 6:1, Reinforced Concrete Pipe Culverts without bars
THD #464**

Size	Lawson Number	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
18"	13800	\$ 411.25	No Bid	No Bid
24"	13801	\$ 595.00	No Bid	No Bid
30"	13802	\$ 743.75	No Bid	No Bid
36"	13803	\$ 1,575.00	No Bid	No Bid

**10.10 Railroad Tank Culverts
No Minimums (price per each)**

Size	Lawson Number	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
6' x 28'		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6'6" x 32'		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7'3" x 28'		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7'3" x 32'		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8' x 32'		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8'6" x 32'		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8'8" x 32'		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9' x 40'		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

10.11 Corrugated Polyethylene Pipe (price per foot)

- a. Conform to AASHTO M294, Type S.
- b. Ends of pipe cut squarely and cleanly.
- c. Pipe shall be ordered in 20' joint sections.
- d. Couplings shall be ordered as desired.
- e. Couplings shall be corrugated to match the pipe corrugations.

Size	Pipe Lawson	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
8" x 20'	1184	\$ 2.56	\$ 2.49	No Bid
10" x 20'	1185	\$ 3.84	\$ 3.74	No Bid
12" x 20'	1186	\$ 4.50	\$ 4.39	No Bid
15" x 20'	1187	\$ 6.58	\$ 6.43	No Bid
18" x 20'	1188	\$ 8.71	\$ 8.51	No Bid
24" x 20'	1189	\$ 15.03	\$ 14.70	No Bid
30" x 20'	1190	\$ 20.74	\$ 20.29	No Bid
36" x 20'	1191	\$ 27.90	\$ 27.30	No Bid
42" x 20'	1192	\$ 40.31	\$ 39.46	No Bid
48" x 20'	1193	\$ 46.70	\$ 45.72	No Bid
60" x 20'	1194	\$ 79.84	\$ 78.17	No Bid
Size	Coupling Lawson	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
8" x 20'	1195	\$ 17.71	\$ 15.50	No Bid
10" x 20'	1196	\$ 23.28	\$ 20.38	No Bid
12" x 20'	1197	\$ 14.18	\$ 12.84	No Bid
15" x 20'	1198	\$ 24.81	\$ 22.49	No Bid
18" x 20'	1199	\$ 29.54	\$ 26.78	No Bid
24" x 20'	1200	\$ 41.36	\$ 37.50	No Bid
30" x 20'	1201	\$ 99.27	\$ 90.04	No Bid
36" x 20'	1202	\$ 135.90	\$ 123.27	No Bid
42" x 20'	1203	\$ 159.54	\$ 144.72	No Bid
48" x 20'	1204	\$ 183.18	\$ 166.16	No Bid
60" x 20'	1205	\$ 277.72	\$ 251.93	No Bid

10.12 Corrugated Polyethylene T's: Conforms to AASHTO M294, Type S (price per each)				
Size	Lawson Number	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
18" x 18" x 18"	11320	\$ 205.89	\$ 180.41	No Bid
24" x 24" x 18"	11321	\$ 302.60	\$ 274.02	No Bid
24" x 24" x 24"	11322	\$ 307.46	\$ 278.91	No Bid
30" x 30" x 30"	11323	\$ 620.45	\$ 562.86	No Bid

10.13 Cast Iron Inlet Grates-Round (used with boxes to drain) No Minimums (price per each)				
Standard Pedestrian Duty				
Size	Lawson Number	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
18"	11324	\$ 84.80	\$ 168.02	No Bid
24"	11325	\$ 131.36	\$ 292.76	No Bid
30"	12523	\$ 250.00	No Bid	No Bid
Traffic Duty				
18"	12524	\$ 84.80	No Bid	No Bid
24"	12525	\$ 131.36	No Bid	No Bid
30"	12526	\$ 250.00	No Bid	No Bid

10.14 Corrugated Dual Wall Polypropylene Pipe (price per foot)
 a. Conforms to AASHTO M330, ASTM F2881 Type S.
 b. Ends of pipe cut squarely and cleanly.
 c. Pipe shall be ordered in 20' joint sections.
 d. Couplings shall be ordered as desired.
 e. Couplings shall be corrugated to match the pipe corrugations.

Size	Pipe Lawson	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
8" x 20'		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10" x 20'		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12" x 20'	13038	\$ 8.00	\$ 7.40	No Bid
15" x 20'	13039	\$ 9.98	\$ 9.24	No Bid
18" x 20'	13040	\$ 13.17	\$ 12.20	No Bid
24" x 20'	13041	\$ 22.22	\$ 20.59	No Bid
30" x 20'	13042	\$ 34.60	\$ 32.08	No Bid
36" x 20'	13043	\$ 37.77	\$ 35.03	No Bid
42" x 20'	13044	\$ 48.65	\$ 45.12	No Bid
48" x 20'	13045	\$ 63.77	\$ 59.15	No Bid
60" x 20'	13046	\$ 99.97	\$ 92.74	No Bid
Size	Coupling Lawson	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
8" x 20'		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10" x 20'		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12" x 20'	13049	13.25	12.94	No Bid
15" x 20'	13050	22.08	22.67	No Bid
18" x 20'	13051	21.07	27.00	No Bid
24" x 20'	13052	28.70	37.80	No Bid
30" x 20'	13053	240.62	220.02	No Bid
36" x 20'	13054	264.88	242.20	No Bid
42" x 20'	13055	162.94	143.90	No Bid
48" x 20'	13056	174.18	159.26	No Bid
60" x 20'	13057	271.75	248.48	No Bid

10.15 Corrugated Dual Wall Polypropylene T's: Conforms to AASHTO M330,

Size	Lawson Number	Accurate Utility Supply	Core & Main	Wyatt Resources
18" x 18" x 18"	13058	278.42	252.56	No Bid
24" x 24" x 18"	13059	422.88	383.62	No Bid
24" x 24" x 24"	13060	430.63	390.49	No Bid
30" x 30" x 30"	13061	868.63	788.02	No Bid