Fort Bend County Tabulation

Bid 19-046

Term Contract for Purchase and Hauling of Chemical Road Materials

Term: 1 April 2019 through 31 March 2020

Awarded 2/26/19: All Bidders Meeting Specifications

CRS-2, Cationic Emulsion, Rapid Setting, THD #300 (price per gallon)

Lawson # 13745 Cleveland Asphalt Martin Asphalt P Squared Emulsion
Products Company Plants
Shepherd Houston Elm Mott
Form 1295
Yes Yes Yes
Minimum Gallon Quantity 5,000 5,000 No Bid
Rosenberg $ 214 $ 2.09 No Bid
Crabb $ 2.14] $ 2.09 No Bid
Fresno $ 214 $ 2.09 No Bid
Needville $ 2.14] $ 2.09 No Bid
Richmond $ 214 $ 2.09 No Bid
Plant $ 2.00] $ 2.00 No Bid
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile No Bid No Bid No Bid
each add'l mile No Bid No Bid No Bid
Restocking Fee No Bid No Bid No Bid
Laydown Charge No Bid NA No Bid
Demurrage Charge $80 per hour $70 per hour No Bid
after 2 free hours after first 2 hours
Plant Location Shepherd South Houston No Bid
Prime Seal/Dust Control (price per gallon)
Lawson # 13746 Cleveland Asphalt Martin Asphalt P Squared Emulsion
Products Company Plants
Undiluted Delivered $ 2.14 No Bid| $ 2.24
Diluted 12:1 Delivered $ 1.64 No Bid| $ 1.30
(cannot return for credit)
Minimum Gallon Quantity 5,000 No Bid 5,000
Demurrage Charge $80 per hour No Bid $80 per hour
after 2 free hours after 2 hours




SS-1 Emulsion used for dust control (price per gallon)

Lawson # 13747 Cleveland Asphalt Martin Asphalt P Squared Emulsion
Products Company Plants
Minimum Gallon Quantity 5,000 5,000 No Bid
Rosenberg $ 2.14] $ 2.09 No Bid
Crabb $ 214 $ 2.09 No Bid
Fresno $ 2.14] $ 2.09 No Bid
Needville $ 214 $ 2.09 No Bid
Richmond $ 2.14] $ 2.09 No Bid
Plant $ 200 $ 2.00 No Bid
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile No Bid No Bid No Bid
each add'l mile No Bid No Bid No Bid
Restocking Fee No Bid NA No Bid
Demurrage Charge $80 per hour $70 per hour No Bid
after 2 free hours after first 2 hours
Plant Location Shepherd South Houston No Bid

Road Stabilizer (price per gallon)

Lawson # 13748 Cleveland Asphalt Martin Asphalt P Squared Emulsion
Products Company Plants
Minimum Gallon Quantity 5,000 No Bid 5,000
Rosenberg $ 2.14 No Bid| $ 2.69
Crabb $ 2.14 No Bid| $ 2.69
Fresno $ 2.14 No Bid| $ 2.69
Needville $ 2.14 No Bid| $ 2.69
Richmond $ 2.14 No Bid| $ 2.69
Plant $ 2.00 No Bid| $ 2.44
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile No Bid No Bid NA
each add'l mile No Bid No Bid NA
Restocking Fee No Bid No Bid| $ 1.39
Demurrage Charge $80 per hour No Bid $80 per hour
after 2 free hours after first 2 hours
Plant Location Shepherd No Bid Elm Mott




Chip Seal Emulsion ""CWE-2"" (price per gallon)

Lawson # 13749 Cleveland Asphalt Martin Asphalt P Squared Emulsion
Products Company Plants

Minimum Gallon Quantity Disqualified: No Bid 5,000
Rosenberg CRS-2 is not equivalent No Bid| $ 3.00
Crabb to CWE-2 as previously No Bid| $ 3.00
Fresno verified. No Bid| $ 3.00
Needville No Bid| $ 3.00
Richmond No Bid| $ 3.00
Plant No Bid| $ 2.75
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile No Bid NA
each add'l mile No Bid NA
Restocking Fee No Bid| $ 1.50
Laydown Charge No Bid NA
Demurrage Charge No Bid $80 per hour
after first 2 hours
Plant Location No Bid Elm Mott

ROC-P2 Road Over Coat

Lawson # 13750

Cleveland Asphalt

Martin Asphalt

P Squared Emulsion

Products Company Plants

Minimum Gallon Quantity No Bid No Bid 5,000
Rosenberg No Bid No Bid| $ 2.85
Crabb No Bid No Bid| $ 2.85
Fresno No Bid No Bid| $ 2.85
Needville No Bid No Bid| $ 2.85
Richmond No Bid No Bid| $ 2.85
Plant No Bid No Bid| $ 2.60
Plant to Jobsite-1st mile No Bid No Bid NA
each add'l mile No Bid No Bid NA
Restocking Fee No Bid No Bid| $ 1.30
Demurrage Charge No Bid No Bid $80 per hour
after first 2 hours

Plant Location No Bid No Bid Elm Mott




	Detail Pricing

