

Fort Bend County Tabulation  
 Bid 20-091  
 COVID-19 Staffing Services

Awarded 07/07/20: all bidders meeting specs  
 (Funding: COVID-19 Grants)

Staffing Hours Description		Angel Staffing, San Antonio, TX	BizTek People Inc, Portland, OR	Donald L. Mooney Enterprises LLC dba Nurses Etc Staffing, San Antonio, TX	The Reserves Network, Inc. dba ExecuTeam Staffing, Houston, TX	Fed Staffing LLC, LaPlace, LA	Guardian Healthcare Providers, Inc., Brentwood, TN	Harris-Jones Staffing & Recruiting Katy, TX	Lane-Staffing Inc., Houston, TX	Octagon Consulting, LLC, Galveston, TX	Pro-Touch Nurse, Inc. dba Protouch Staffing, Frisco, TX	ROI Insight Group LLC, Arch Staffing Consulting & Houston, TX	Staff-factory LLC, Los Angeles, CA	Staffing Solutions Inc., Houston, TX	Texas Management Division, Inc., TMD Staffing, Houston, TX	Training and Leadership Consulting LLC, Houston, TX	Tryfacta, Inc. Pleasanton, CA
Contact Information		210-616-9526, Kathy Gallagher, kathy@angelstaffing.net	503-887-0165, Sadhana Bharadwaj, sadhana@bi-dteckpeople.com	210-566-9995, Jennifer Larios Eddy, Jlarios@nursesetc.net	713-952-6760, Laura Bowen, laura@executeam.com	225-206-1545, Kent StAmant, kent@fedstaffing.com	615-377-9140 Ext 207, Michael Shabal, mshabal@guardianhealthcare.com	832-800-3921, Constance Jones, cjones@hjstaffing.com	713-522-0000, Carla K Lane, clane@lanestaff.com	281-962-8020, Stephanie Walker, swalker@octagonhr.com	713-789-7868, Robin Terrell, robin@protouchstaffing.com	832-439-1419, Jamal Allen, jamal.allen@archstaffing.us	310-929-8421, Chiraz Kelly, govt@staffactory.com	281-990-3236, Grace Rubio, grace@staffingsolutionsnow.com	281-966-0090, Kelly Marler, kelly.marler@texasmgmt.com	713-835-8361, Demetra Jones, info@tlconsulting.com	952-640-3641, Arman Dhar, RFP@tryfacta.ai
12.1	Data Entry	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour
	Normal Buisness Hours Monday through Friday 8:00AM through 5:00PM	\$ 37.50	\$ 22.00	\$ 25.50	\$ 18.90	\$ 33.00	No Bid	\$ 19.95	\$ 20.23	\$ 25.50	\$ 25.00	\$ 21.12	\$ 17.81	\$ 32.00	\$ 16.80	\$ 19.65	\$ 24.60
	Evening Hours Monday through Friday 6:00PM through 11:30PM	\$ 37.50	\$ 22.00	\$ 25.50	\$ 21.60	\$ 34.50	No Bid	\$ 19.95	\$ 22.66	\$ 25.50	\$ 25.00	\$ 21.78	\$ 19.81	\$ 32.00	\$ 18.20	\$ 23.58	\$ 25.51
	Weekend Hours Saturday through Sunday 8:00AM through 2:00PM	\$ 37.50	\$ 22.00	\$ 25.50	\$ 21.60	\$ 36.00	No Bid	\$ 19.95	\$ 23.67	\$ 25.50	\$ 28.00	\$ 22.44	\$ 26.72	\$ 35.00	\$ 18.20	\$ 23.58	\$ 25.51
	Holiday Hours	\$ 56.25	\$ 22.00	No Bid	\$ 28.50	\$ 49.50	No Bid	\$ 29.93	\$ 22.66	\$ 25.50	\$37.50-\$42.00	\$ 42.24	\$ 26.72	\$ 35.00	\$ 33.60	\$ 39.30	\$ 25.51

Item	Staffing Positions	Angel Staffing, San Antonio, TX	BizTek People Inc, Portland, OR	Donald L. Mooney Enterprises LLC dba Nurses Etc Staffing, San Antonio, TX	The Reserves Network, Inc. dba ExecuTeam Staffing, Houston, TX	Fed Staffing LLC, LaPlace, LA	Guardian Healthcare Providers, Inc., Brentwood TN	Harris-Jones Staffing & Recruiting Katy, TX	Lane-Staffing Inc., HoustonTX	Octagon Consulting, LLC, Galveston, TX	Pro-Touch Nurse, Inc. dba Protouch Staffing, Frisco, TX	ROI Insight Group LLC, Houston TX	Staff-factory LLC, Los Angeles, CA	Staffing Solutions Inc., Houston, TX	Texas Management Division, Inc., TMD Staffing, Houston, TX	Training and Leadership Consulting LLC, Houston, TX	Tryfacta, Inc. Pleasanton, CA
12.2	Lead Contact Tracer	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour
	Normal Buisness Hours Monday through Friday 8:00AM through 5:00PM	\$ 73.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 51.30	\$ 49.50	No Bid	\$ 21.28	\$ 31.32	\$ 93.75	\$ 45.00	\$ 57.47	\$ 36.99	\$ 49.00	\$ 19.60	\$ 23.58	\$ 35.07
	Evening Hours Monday through Friday 6:00PM through 11:30PM	\$ 73.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 51.50	No Bid	\$ 21.28	\$ 35.08	\$ 93.75	\$ 45.00	\$ 58.13	\$ 38.99	\$ 49.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 26.20	\$ 36.37
	Weekend Hours Saturday through Sunday 8:00AM through 2:00PM	\$ 73.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 53.00	No Bid	\$ 21.28	\$ 36.64	\$ 93.75	\$ 47.00	\$ 58.79	\$ 55.49	\$ 52.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 26.20	\$ 36.37
	Holiday Hours	\$ 109.50	\$ 28.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 76.95	\$ 74.25	No Bid	\$ 31.92	\$ 35.08	\$ 93.75	\$67.50-\$70.50	\$ 114.95	\$ 55.49	\$ 52.00	\$ 39.20	\$ 47.16	\$ 36.37

Item	Staffing Positions	Angel Staffing, San Antonio, TX	BizTek People Inc, Portland, OR	Donald L. Mooney Enterprises LLC dba Nurses Etc Staffing, San Antonio, TX	The Reserves Network, Inc. dba ExecuTeam Staffing, Houston, TX	Fed Staffing LLC, LaPlace, LA	Guardian Healthcare Providers, Inc., Brentwood TN	Harris-Jones Staffing & Recruiting Katy, TX	Lane-Staffing Inc., HoustonTX	Octagon Consulting, LLC, Galveston, TX	Pro-Touch Nurse, Inc. dba Protouch Staffing, Frisco, TX	ROI Insight Group LLC, Houston TX	Staff-factory LLC, Los Angeles, CA	Staffing Solutions Inc., Houston, TX	Texas Management Division, Inc., TMD Staffing, Houston, TX	Training and Leadership Consulting LLC, Houston, TX	Tryfacta, Inc. Pleasanton, CA
12.3	RN Nurse	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour
	Normal Business Hours Monday through Friday 8:00AM through 5:00PM	\$ 67.00	No Bid	\$ 57.00	\$ 54.00	\$111.75	\$ 65.00	No Bid	\$ 32.63	\$ 125.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 46.20	\$ 50.69	\$ 60.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 49.71
	Evening Hours Monday through Friday 6:00PM through 11:30PM	\$ 67.00	No Bid	\$ 57.00	\$ 56.70	\$113.75	\$ 65.00	No Bid	\$ 36.55	\$ 125.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 46.86	\$ 52.69	\$ 60.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 51.55
	Weekend Hours Saturday through Sunday 8:00AM through 2:00PM	\$ 67.00	No Bid	\$ 57.00	\$ 56.70	\$115.75	\$ 66.00	No Bid	\$ 38.18	\$ 125.00	\$ 62.00	\$ 47.52	\$ 76.04	\$ 65.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 51.55
	Holiday Hours	\$ 100.50	No Bid	\$ 85.50	\$ 81.00	\$167.63	\$ 97.50	No Bid	\$ 36.55	\$ 125.00	\$90.00-\$93.00	\$ 92.40	\$ 76.04	\$ 65.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 51.55

Item	Staffing Positions	Angel Staffing, San Antonio, TX	BizTek People Inc, Portland, OR	Donald L. Mooney Enterprises LLC dba Nurses Etc Staffing, San Antonio, TX	The Reserves Network, Inc. dba ExecuTeam Staffing, Houston, TX	Fed Staffing LLC, LaPlace, LA	Guardian Healthcare Providers, Inc., Brentwood TN	Harris-Jones Staffing & Recruiting Katy, TX	Lane-Staffing Inc., HoustonTX	Octagon Consulting, LLC, Galveston, TX	Pro-Touch Nurse, Inc. dba Protouch Staffing, Frisco, TX	ROI Insight Group LLC, Houston TX	Staff-factory LLC, Los Angeles, CA	Staffing Solutions Inc., Houston, TX	Texas Management Division, Inc., TMD Staffing, Houston, TX	Training and Leadership Consulting LLC, Houston, TX	Tryfacta, Inc. Pleasanton, CA
12.3	LVN Nurse	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour
	Normal Business Hours Monday through Friday 8:00AM through 5:00PM	\$ 56.00	No Bid	\$ 42.00	\$ 37.80	\$ 87.70	\$ 55.00	No Bid	\$ 24.80	\$ 85.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 33.00	\$ 34.25	\$ 53.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 30.02
	Evening Hours Monday through Friday 6:00PM through 11:30PM	\$ 56.00	No Bid	\$ 42.00	\$ 40.50	\$ 90.70	\$ 55.00	No Bid	\$ 27.78	\$ 85.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 33.66	\$ 36.25	\$ 53.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 31.14
	Weekend Hours Saturday through Sunday 8:00AM through 2:00PM	\$ 56.00	No Bid	\$ 42.00	\$ 40.50	\$ 93.70	\$ 56.00	No Bid	\$ 29.02	\$ 85.00	\$ 47.00	\$ 34.32	\$ 51.38	\$ 58.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 31.14
	Holiday Hours	\$ 84.00	No Bid	\$ 63.00	\$ 56.70	\$131.55	\$ 82.50	No Bid	\$ 27.78	\$ 85.00	\$67.50-\$70.50	\$ 66.00	\$ 51.38	\$ 58.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 31.14

Item	Staffing Positions	Angel Staffing, San Antonio, TX	BizTek People Inc, Portland, OR	Donald L. Mooney Enterprises LLC dba Nurses Etc Staffing, San Antonio, TX	The Reserves Network, Inc. dba ExecuTeam Staffing, Houston, TX	Fed Staffing LLC, LaPlace, LA	Guardian Healthcare Providers, Inc., Brentwood TN	Harris-Jones Staffing & Recruiting Katy, TX	Lane-Staffing Inc., HoustonTX	Octagon Consulting, LLC, Galveston, TX	Pro-Touch Nurse, Inc. dba Protouch Staffing, Frisco, TX	ROI Insight Group LLC, Houston TX	Staff-factory LLC, Los Angeles, CA	Staffing Solutions Inc., Houston, TX	Texas Management Division, Inc., TMD Staffing, Houston, TX	Training and Leadership Consulting LLC, Houston, TX	Tryfacta, Inc. Pleasanton, CA
12.4	Infection Control Practitioner	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour
	Normal Business Hours Monday through Friday 8:00AM through 5:00PM	\$ 67.00	No Bid	\$ 60.00	\$ 51.30	\$345.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 52.20	\$ 129.00	\$ 61.00	\$ 58.95	\$ 65.76	\$ 60.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 66.01
	Evening Hours Monday through Friday 6:00PM through 11:30PM	\$ 67.00	No Bid	\$ 60.00	\$ 54.00	\$347.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 58.46	\$ 129.00	\$ 61.00	\$ 59.61	\$ 67.76	\$ 60.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 68.46
	Weekend Hours Saturday through Sunday 8:00AM through 2:00PM	\$ 67.00	No Bid	\$ 60.00	\$ 54.00	\$349.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 61.07	\$ 129.00	\$ 63.00	\$ 60.27	\$ 98.64	\$ 68.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 68.46
	Holiday Hours	\$ 100.50	No Bid	\$ 90.00	\$ 81.00	\$395.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 58.46	\$ 129.00	\$91.50-\$94.50	\$ 117.90	\$ 98.64	\$ 68.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 68.46

Item	Staffing Positions	Angel Staffing, San Antonio, TX	BizTek People Inc, Portland, OR	Donald L. Mooney Enterprises LLC dba Nurses Etc Staffing, San Antonio, TX	The Reserves Network, Inc. dba ExecuTeam Staffing, Houston, TX	Fed Staffing LLC, LaPlace, LA	Guardian Healthcare Providers, Inc., Brentwood TN	Harris-Jones Staffing & Recruiting Katy, TX	Lane-Staffing Inc., HoustonTX	Octagon Consulting, LLC, Galveston, TX	Pro-Touch Nurse, Inc. dba Protouch Staffing, Frisco, TX	ROI Insight Group LLC, Houston TX	Staff-factory LLC, Los Angeles, CA	Staffing Solutions Inc., Houston, TX	Texas Management Division, Inc., TMD Staffing, Houston, TX	Training and Leadership Consulting LLC, Houston, TX	Tryfacta, Inc. Pleasanton, CA
12.5	Medical Assistant	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour
	Normal Buisness Hours Monday through Friday 8:00AM through 5:00PM	\$ 37.50	No Bid	\$ 27.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 33.75	\$ 30.00	No Bid	\$ 22.84	\$ 22.50	\$ 29.00	\$ 22.44	\$ 28.77	\$ 32.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 25.62
	Evening Hours Monday through Friday 6:00PM through 11:30PM	\$ 37.50	No Bid	\$ 27.00	\$ 29.70	\$ 35.75	\$ 30.00	No Bid	\$ 25.58	\$ 22.50	\$ 29.00	\$ 23.10	\$ 30.77	\$ 32.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 26.56
	Weekend Hours Saturday through Sunday 8:00AM through 2:00PM	\$ 37.50	No Bid	\$ 27.00	\$ 29.70	\$ 36.75	\$ 31.00	No Bid	\$ 26.72	\$ 22.50	\$ 31.00	\$ 23.76	\$ 43.16	\$ 35.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 26.56
	Holiday Hours	\$ 56.25	No Bid	\$ 40.50	\$ 40.50	\$ 50.63	\$ 45.00	No Bid	\$ 25.58	\$ 22.50	\$43.50-\$46.50	\$ 44.88	\$ 43.16	\$ 35.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 26.56

Item	Staffing Positions	Angel Staffing, San Antonio, TX	BizTek People Inc, Portland, OR	Donald L. Mooney Enterprises LLC dba Nurses Etc Staffing, San Antonio, TX	The Reserves Network, Inc. dba ExecuTeam Staffing, Houston, TX	Fed Staffing LLC, LaPlace, LA	Guardian Healthcare Providers, Inc., Brentwood TN	Harris-Jones Staffing & Recruiting Katy, TX	Lane-Staffing Inc., HoustonTX	Octagon Consulting, LLC, Galveston, TX	Pro-Touch Nurse, Inc. dba Protouch Staffing, Frisco, TX	ROI Insight Group LLC, Houston TX	Staff-factory LLC, Los Angeles, CA	Staffing Solutions Inc., Houston, TX	Texas Management Division, Inc., TMD Staffing, Houston, TX	Training and Leadership Consulting LLC, Houston, TX	Tryfacta, Inc. Pleasanton, CA
12.6	Pharmacist	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour
	Normal Business Hours Monday through Friday 8:00AM through 5:00PM	\$ 233.50	No Bid	\$ 85.00	\$ 78.30	\$115.17	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 67.86	\$ 140.00	No Bid	\$ 87.87	\$ 87.68	\$ 100.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 95.72
	Evening Hours Monday through Friday 6:00PM through 11:30PM	\$ 233.50	No Bid	\$ 85.00	\$ 81.00	\$118.17	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 76.00	\$ 140.00	No Bid	\$ 88.53	\$ 89.68	\$ 100.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 99.27
	Weekend Hours Saturday through Sunday 8:00AM through 2:00PM	\$ 233.50	No Bid	\$ 85.00	\$ 81.00	\$121.17	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 79.40	\$ 140.00	No Bid	\$ 89.19	\$ 131.52	\$ 110.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 99.27
	Holiday Hours	\$ 350.25	No Bid	\$ 127.50	\$ 117.45	\$172.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 76.00	\$ 140.00	No Bid	\$ 175.74	\$ 131.52	\$ 110.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 99.27

Item	Staffing Positions	Angel Staffing, San Antonio, TX	BizTek People Inc, Portland, OR	Donald L. Mooney Enterprises LLC dba Nurses Etc Staffing, San Antonio, TX	The Reserves Network, Inc. dba ExecuTeam Staffing, Houston, TX	Fed Staffing LLC, LaPlace, LA	Guardian Healthcare Providers, Inc., Brentwood TN	Harris-Jones Staffing & Recruiting Katy, TX	Lane-Staffing Inc., HoustonTX	Octagon Consulting, LLC, Galveston, TX	Pro-Touch Nurse, Inc. dba Protouch Staffing, Frisco, TX	ROI Insight Group LLC, Houston TX	Staff-factory LLC, Los Angeles, CA	Staffing Solutions Inc., Houston, TX	Texas Management Division, Inc., TMD Staffing, Houston, TX	Training and Leadership Consulting LLC, Houston, TX	Tryfacta, Inc. Pleasanton, CA
12.7	Physician	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour
	Normal Buisness Hours Monday through Friday 8:00AM through 5:00PM	\$ 310.00	No Bid	\$ 147.00	\$ 101.25	\$425.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 91.35	\$ 250.00	No Bid	\$ 209.88	\$ 137.00	\$ 175.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 153.73
	Evening Hours Monday through Friday 6:00PM through 11:30PM	\$ 310.00	No Bid	\$ 147.00	\$ 103.95	\$430.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 102.31	\$ 250.00	No Bid	\$ 210.54	\$ 139.00	\$ 175.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 159.43
	Weekend Hours Saturday through Sunday 8:00AM through 2:00PM	\$ 310.00	No Bid	\$ 147.00	\$ 103.95	\$435.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 106.88	\$ 250.00	No Bid	\$ 211.20	\$ 205.50	\$ 200.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 159.43
	Holiday Hours	\$ 465.00	No Bid	\$ 220.50	\$ 205.04	\$470.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 102.31	\$ 250.00	No Bid	\$ 419.76	\$ 205.50	\$ 200.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 159.43

Item	Staffing Positions	Angel Staffing, San Antonio, TX	BizTek People Inc, Portland, OR	Donald L. Mooney Enterprises LLC dba Nurses Etc Staffing, San Antonio, TX	The Reserves Network, Inc. dba ExecuTeam Staffing, Houston, TX	Fed Staffing LLC, LaPlace, LA	Guardian Healthcare Providers, Inc., Brentwood TN	Harris-Jones Staffing & Recruiting Katy, TX	Lane-Staffing Inc., HoustonTX	Octagon Consulting, LLC, Galveston, TX	Pro-Touch Nurse, Inc. dba Protouch Staffing, Frisco, TX	ROI Insight Group LLC, Houston TX	Staff-factory LLC, Los Angeles, CA	Staffing Solutions Inc., Houston, TX	Texas Management Division, Inc., TMD Staffing, Houston, TX	Training and Leadership Consulting LLC, Houston, TX	Tryfacta, Inc. Pleasanton, CA
12.8	Call Center Agent	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour
	Normal Buisness Hours Monday through Friday 8:00AM through 5:00PM	\$ 37.50	\$ 25.00	\$ 22.50	\$ 18.90	\$ 47.38	No Bid	\$ 17.29	\$ 18.27	\$ 24.75	\$ 23.00	\$ 19.80	\$ 26.03	\$ 32.00	\$ 19.60	\$ 28.82	\$ 24.37
	Evening Hours Monday through Friday 6:00PM through 11:30PM	\$ 37.50	\$ 25.00	\$ 22.50	\$ 20.25	\$ 50.74	No Bid	\$ 17.29	\$ 20.46	\$ 24.75	\$ 23.00	\$ 20.46	\$ 28.03	\$ 32.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 25.27
	Weekend Hours Saturday through Sunday 8:00AM through 2:00PM	\$ 37.50	\$ 25.00	\$ 22.50	\$ 20.25	\$ 52.39	No Bid	\$ 17.29	\$ 21.38	\$ 24.75	\$ 25.00	\$ 21.12	\$ 39.05	\$ 35.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 28.82	\$ 25.27
	Holiday Hours	\$ 56.25	\$ 25.00	\$ 33.75	\$ 28.35	\$ 71.07	No Bid	\$ 25.94	\$ 20.46	\$ 24.75	\$34.50-\$37.50	\$ 39.40	\$ 39.05	\$ 35.00	\$ 39.20	\$ 47.16	\$ 25.27

Item	Staffing Positions	Angel Staffing, San Antonio, TX	BizTek People Inc, Portland, OR	Donald L. Mooney Enterprises LLC dba Nurses Etc Staffing, San Antonio, TX	The Reserves Network, Inc. dba ExecuTeam Staffing, Houston, TX	Fed Staffing LLC, LaPlace, LA	Guardian Healthcare Providers, Inc., Brentwood TN	Harris-Jones Staffing & Recruiting Katy, TX	Lane-Staffing Inc., HoustonTX	Octagon Consulting, LLC, Galveston, TX	Pro-Touch Nurse, Inc. dba Protouch Staffing, Frisco, TX	ROI Insight Group LLC, Houston TX	Staff-factory LLC, Los Angeles, CA	Staffing Solutions Inc., Houston, TX	Texas Management Division, Inc., TMD Staffing, Houston, TX	Training and Leadership Consulting LLC, Houston, TX	Tryfacta, Inc. Pleasanton, CA
12.9	Administrative Assistant	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour
	Normal Business Hours Monday through Friday 8:00AM through 5:00PM	\$ 37.50	\$ 25.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 21.60	\$ 49.50	No Bid	\$ 21.28	\$ 20.88	\$ 30.00	\$ 26.00	\$ 26.40	\$ 47.95	\$ 32.00	\$ 16.80	\$ 26.20	\$ 22.63
	Evening Hours Monday through Friday 6:00PM through 11:30PM	\$ 37.50	\$ 25.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 22.95	\$ 52.80	No Bid	\$ 21.28	\$ 23.39	\$ 30.00	\$ 26.00	\$ 27.06	\$ 49.95	\$ 32.00	\$ 18.20	\$ 31.44	\$ 23.46
	Weekend Hours Saturday through Sunday 8:00AM through 2:00PM	\$ 37.50	\$ 25.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 22.95	\$ 54.45	No Bid	\$ 21.28	\$ 24.43	\$ 30.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 27.72	\$ 71.93	\$ 35.00	\$ 18.20	\$ 31.44	\$ 23.46
	Holiday Hours	\$ 56.25	\$ 25.00	\$ 36.00	\$ 32.40	\$ 74.25	No Bid	\$ 31.92	\$ 23.39	\$ 30.00	\$39.00-\$42.00	\$ 52.80	\$ 71.93	\$ 35.00	\$ 33.60	\$ 52.40	\$ 23.46

Item	Staffing Positions	Angel Staffing, San Antonio, TX	BizTek People Inc, Portland, OR	Donald L. Mooney Enterprises LLC dba Nurses Etc Staffing, San Antonio, TX	The Reserves Network, Inc. dba ExecuTeam Staffing, Houston, TX	Fed Staffing LLC, LaPlace, LA	Guardian Healthcare Providers, Inc., Brentwood TN	Harris-Jones Staffing & Recruiting Katy, TX	Lane-Staffing Inc., HoustonTX	Octagon Consulting, LLC, Galveston, TX	Pro-Touch Nurse, Inc. dba Protouch Staffing, Frisco, TX	ROI Insight Group LLC, Houston TX	Staff-factory LLC, Los Angeles, CA	Staffing Solutions Inc., Houston, TX	Texas Management Division, Inc., TMD Staffing, Houston, TX	Training and Leadership Consulting LLC, Houston, TX	Tryfacta, Inc. Pleasanton, CA
12.10	Administrative Support	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour
	Normal Business Hours Monday through Friday 8:00AM through 5:00PM	\$ 37.50	\$ 22.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 18.90	\$ 41.25	No Bid	\$ 21.28	\$ 22.19	\$ 29.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 21.12	\$ 41.10	\$ 32.00	\$ 16.80	\$ 23.58	\$ 22.63
	Evening Hours Monday through Friday 6:00PM through 11:30PM	\$ 37.50	\$ 22.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 20.25	\$ 43.75	No Bid	\$ 21.28	\$ 24.85	\$ 29.00	\$ 23.00	\$ 21.78	\$ 43.10	\$ 32.00	\$ 18.20	\$ 28.82	\$ 23.46
	Weekend Hours Saturday through Sunday 8:00AM through 2:00PM	\$ 37.50	\$ 22.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 20.25	\$ 46.25	No Bid	\$ 21.28	\$ 25.96	\$ 29.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 22.44	\$ 61.65	\$ 35.00	\$ 18.20	\$ 28.82	\$ 23.46
	Holiday Hours	\$ 56.25	\$ 22.00	\$ 33.00	\$ 28.35	\$ 61.88	No Bid	\$ 31.92	\$ 24.85	\$ 29.00	\$34.50-\$37.50	\$ 42.24	\$ 61.65	\$ 35.00	\$ 33.60	\$ 52.40	\$ 23.46

Item	Staffing Positions	Angel Staffing, San Antonio, TX	BizTek People Inc, Portland, OR	Donald L. Mooney Enterprises LLC dba Nurses Etc Staffing, San Antonio, TX	The Reserves Network, Inc. dba ExecuTeam Staffing, Houston, TX	Fed Staffing LLC, LaPlace, LA	Guardian Healthcare Providers, Inc., Brentwood TN	Harris-Jones Staffing & Recruiting Katy, TX	Lane-Staffing Inc., HoustonTX	Octagon Consulting, LLC, Galveston, TX	Pro-Touch Nurse, Inc. dba Protouch Staffing, Frisco, TX	ROI Insight Group LLC, Houston TX	Staff-factory LLC, Los Angeles, CA	Staffing Solutions Inc., Houston, TX	Texas Management Division, Inc., TMD Staffing, Houston, TX	Training and Leadership Consulting LLC, Houston, TX	Tryfacta, Inc. Pleasanton, CA
12.11	GIS Specialist	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour
	Normal Business Hours Monday through Friday 8:00AM through 5:00PM	\$ 56.00	\$ 72.00	\$ 57.00	\$ 33.75	\$110.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 28.71	\$ 43.00	\$ 41.00	\$ 52.60	\$ 58.91	\$ 49.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 39.79
	Evening Hours Monday through Friday 6:00PM through 11:30PM	\$ 56.00	\$ 72.00	\$ 57.00	\$ 35.10	\$112.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 32.16	\$ 43.00	\$ 41.00	\$ 53.26	\$ 60.91	\$ 49.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 41.26
	Weekend Hours Saturday through Sunday 8:00AM through 2:00PM	\$ 56.00	\$ 72.00	\$ 57.00	\$ 35.10	\$113.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 33.59	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	\$ 53.92	\$ 88.37	\$ 52.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 41.26
	Holiday Hours	\$ 84.00	\$ 72.00	\$ 85.50	\$ 50.63	\$166.13	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 32.16	\$ 43.00	\$61.50-\$64.50	\$ 105.20	\$ 88.37	\$ 52.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 41.26

Item	Staffing Positions	Angel Staffing, San Antonio, TX	BizTek People Inc, Portland, OR	Donald L. Mooney Enterprises LLC dba Nurses Etc Staffing, San Antonio, TX	The Reserves Network, Inc. dba ExecuTeam Staffing, Houston, TX	Fed Staffing LLC, LaPlace, LA	Guardian Healthcare Providers, Inc., Brentwood TN	Harris-Jones Staffing & Recruiting Katy, TX	Lane-Staffing Inc., HoustonTX	Octagon Consulting, LLC, Galveston, TX	Pro-Touch Nurse, Inc. dba Protouch Staffing, Frisco, TX	ROI Insight Group LLC, Houston TX	Staff-factory LLC, Los Angeles, CA	Staffing Solutions Inc., Houston, TX	Texas Management Division, Inc., TMD Staffing, Houston, TX	Training and Leadership Consulting LLC, Houston, TX	Tryfacta, Inc. Pleasanton, CA
12.12	CDL Driver	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour
	Normal Business Hours Monday through Friday 8:00AM through 5:00PM	No Bid	\$ 35.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 37.80	\$ 65.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 22.19	\$ 56.00	\$ 39.00	\$ 29.00	\$ 45.21	\$ 49.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 34.77
	Evening Hours Monday through Friday 6:00PM through 11:30PM	No Bid	\$ 35.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 39.15	\$ 68.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 24.85	\$ 56.00	\$ 39.00	\$ 29.66	\$ 47.21	\$ 49.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 36.05
	Weekend Hours Saturday through Sunday 8:00AM through 2:00PM	No Bid	\$ 35.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 39.15	\$ 70.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 25.96	\$ 56.00	\$ 41.00	\$ 30.32	\$ 67.82	\$ 52.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 36.05
	Holiday Hours	No Bid	\$ 35.00	\$ 40.50	\$ 56.70	\$ 98.10	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 24.85	\$ 56.00	\$58.50-\$61.50	\$ 58.00	\$ 67.82	\$ 52.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 36.05

Item	Staffing Positions	Angel Staffing, San Antonio, TX	BizTek People Inc, Portland, OR	Donald L. Mooney Enterprises LLC dba Nurses Etc Staffing, San Antonio, TX	The Reserves Network, Inc. dba ExecuTeam Staffing, Houston, TX	Fed Staffing LLC, LaPlace, LA	Guardian Healthcare Providers, Inc., Brentwood TN	Harris-Jones Staffing & Recruiting Katy, TX	Lane-Staffing Inc., HoustonTX	Octagon Consulting, LLC, Galveston, TX	Pro-Touch Nurse, Inc. dba Protouch Staffing, Frisco, TX	ROI Insight Group LLC, Houston TX	Staff-factory LLC, Los Angeles, CA	Staffing Solutions Inc., Houston, TX	Texas Management Division, Inc., TMD Staffing, Houston, TX	Training and Leadership Consulting LLC, Houston, TX	Tryfacta, Inc. Pleasanton, CA
12.13	Driver	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour
	Normal Business Hours Monday through Friday 8:00AM through 5:00PM	No Bid	\$ 26.00	\$ 22.50	\$ 27.00	\$ 59.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 20.88	\$ 56.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 21.12	\$ 20.55	\$ 32.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 31.75
	Evening Hours Monday through Friday 6:00PM through 11:30PM	No Bid	\$ 26.00	\$ 22.50	\$ 28.35	\$ 60.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 23.39	\$ 56.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 21.78	\$ 22.55	\$ 32.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 32.92
	Weekend Hours Saturday through Sunday 8:00AM through 2:00PM	No Bid	\$ 26.00	\$ 22.50	\$ 28.35	\$ 61.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 24.43	\$ 56.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 22.44	\$ 30.83	\$ 35.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 32.92
	Holiday Hours	No Bid	\$ 26.00	\$ 33.75	\$ 40.50	\$ 89.62	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 23.39	\$ 56.00	\$33.00-\$36.00	\$ 42.24	\$ 30.83	\$ 35.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 32.92

Item	Staffing Positions	Angel Staffing, San Antonio, TX	BizTek People Inc, Portland, OR	Donald L. Mooney Enterprises LLC dba Nurses Etc Staffing, San Antonio, TX	The Reserves Network, Inc. dba ExecuTeam Staffing, Houston, TX	Fed Staffing LLC, LaPlace, LA	Guardian Healthcare Providers, Inc., Brentwood TN	Harris-Jones Staffing & Recruiting Katy, TX	Lane-Staffing Inc., HoustonTX	Octagon Consulting, LLC, Galveston, TX	Pro-Touch Nurse, Inc. dba Protouch Staffing, Frisco, TX	ROI Insight Group LLC, Houston TX	Staff-factory LLC, Los Angeles, CA	Staffing Solutions Inc., Houston, TX	Texas Management Division, Inc., TMD Staffing, Houston, TX	Training and Leadership Consulting LLC, Houston, TX	Tryfacta, Inc. Pleasanton, CA
12.14	Biostatistician	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour
	Normal Business Hours Monday through Friday 8:00AM through 5:00PM	\$ 78.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 73.50	\$ 47.25	\$ 85.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 45.68	\$ 75.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 51.28	\$ 82.20	\$ 49.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 61.35
	Evening Hours Monday through Friday 6:00PM through 11:30PM	\$ 78.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 73.50	\$ 48.60	\$ 87.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 51.16	\$ 75.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 51.94	\$ 84.20	\$ 49.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 63.62
	Weekend Hours Saturday through Sunday 8:00AM through 2:00PM	\$ 78.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 73.50	\$ 48.60	\$ 88.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 53.45	\$ 75.00	\$ 57.00	\$ 52.60	\$ 123.30	\$ 52.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 63.62
	Holiday Hours	\$ 117.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 110.25	\$ 70.88	\$127.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 51.16	\$ 75.00	\$82.50-\$85.50	\$ 102.56	\$ 123.30	\$ 52.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 63.62

Item	Staffing Positions	Angel Staffing, San Antonio, TX	BizTek People Inc, Portland, OR	Donald L. Mooney Enterprises LLC dba Nurses Etc Staffing, San Antonio, TX	The Reserves Network, Inc. dba ExecuTeam Staffing, Houston, TX	Fed Staffing LLC, LaPlace, LA	Guardian Healthcare Providers, Inc., Brentwood TN	Harris-Jones Staffing & Recruiting Katy, TX	Lane-Staffing Inc., HoustonTX	Octagon Consulting, LLC, Galveston, TX	Pro-Touch Nurse, Inc. dba Protouch Staffing, Frisco, TX	ROI Insight Group LLC, Houston TX	Staff-factory LLC, Los Angeles, CA	Staffing Solutions Inc., Houston, TX	Texas Management Division, Inc., TMD Staffing, Houston, TX	Training and Leadership Consulting LLC, Houston, TX	Tryfacta, Inc. Pleasanton, CA
12.15	Licensed Clinical Social Worker	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour	Bid Price per each Hour
	Normal Buisness Hours Monday through Friday 8:00AM through 5:00PM	\$ 73.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 57.00	\$ 47.25	\$116.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 32.63	\$ 65.00	\$ 52.00	\$ 45.57	\$ 49.32	\$ 60.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 50.33
	Evening Hours Monday through Friday 6:00PM through 11:30PM	\$ 73.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 57.00	\$ 48.60	\$118.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 36.55	\$ 65.00	\$ 52.00	\$ 46.23	\$ 51.32	\$ 60.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 52.19
	Weekend Hours Saturday through Sunday 8:00AM through 2:00PM	\$ 73.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 57.00	\$ 48.60	\$119.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 38.18	\$ 65.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 46.89	\$ 73.98	\$ 65.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 52.19
	Holiday Hours	\$ 109.50	\$ 40.00	\$ 85.50	\$ 70.86	\$175.13	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 36.55	\$ 65.00	\$78.00-\$81.00	\$ 91.13	\$ 73.98	\$ 65.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 52.19
	22nd Century Technologies, Inc.	Disqualified: Did not provide pricing form as required.															
4 Consulting Inc.	Disqualified: Did not provide required current proof of insurance.																
The Burnett Companies Consolidated, Inc. dba Burnett Specialists	Disqualified: Did not provide pricing form as required.																
Confidential Search Solutions, LLC	Disqualified: Did not provide pricing form as required.																
Crowder HR Consulting Firm, LLC	Disqualified: Did not provide required proof of insurance. Did not provide pricing form as required.																
Diskriter, Inc.	Disqualified: Did not provide pricing form as required.																
GET Corp. Paroll Accounting & Tax dba GET Hire Staffing	Disqualified: Did not provide required proof of insurance. Did not provide pricing form as required.																
Howroyd-Wright Employment Agency, Inc.	Disqualified: Altered terms and conditions.																

Huckeye Health Services LLC	Disqualified: Did not provide required proof of insurance. Did not provide pricing form as required.
Medical Edge Recruitment LLC	Disqualified: Did not provide required current proof of insurance.
Medix Staffing Solutions, Inc.	Disqualified: Did not provide required proof of insurance. Did not provide all required forms.
Midtown Personnel, Inc.	Disqualified: Did not return entire bid contract.
PHD Resources & Taxes LLC	Disqualified: Did not provide pricing form as required.
Recruiting Source International, LLC	Disqualified: Did not provide pricing form as required.
Staff Today Inc.	Disqualified: Did not provide pricing form as required.
Smarter HR Solutions, LLC	Disqualified: Did not provide pricing form as required.
Smith & Dean, Inc.	Disqualified: Did not provide pricing form as required.
Spring Staffing Services LLC	Disqualified: Did not provide required proof of insurance.
St. Vincent DePaul Rehabilitation Service of Texas, Inc. dba Peak Performers	Disqualified: Did not provide pricing form as required.
Superlanet Inc.	Disqualified: Did not provide pricing form as required.